
1297

Panaji, 5th November, 2020 (Kartika 14, 1942) SERIES I No. 32

Reg. No. G-2/RNP/GOA/32/2018-2020 RNI No. GOAENG/2002/6410

PUBLISHED  BY  AUTHORITY

Suggestions are welcomed on e-mail: dir–gpps.goa@nic.in

NOTE

There are three Extraordinary issues to the Official Gazette, Series I No. 31 dated 29-10-2020, namely:—

(1) Extraordinary dated 29-10-2020 from pages 1277 to 1278 from Department of Finance (R & C), Notifications

regarding GST.

(2) Extraordinary (No. 2) dated 30-10-2020 from pages 1279 to 1292 from Department of Finance (R & C), Notifications

regarding GST.

(3) Extraordinary (No. 3) dated 4-11-2020 from pages 1293 to 1296 from Department of Home, Notification No. 21/5/

2020-HD(G)/2425 regarding amendment of Govt. Notification dated 23-11-1995.

INDEX

Department Order/Notification/Corri. Subject Pages

1.a. Animal Husbandry & Corri.- 13-91/Kamd/(S)/ — 1297

Veterinary Services 2020-21/4437

Dir. & ex officio Jt. Secy.

2. Civil Supplies & Not.- DCS/ENF/C.O/FS/ The Removal of Licensing Requirement 1299

Consumer Affairs 20-21/322 Stock Limits and Movement Restriction on

Dir. & ex officio Jt. Secy. specified Foodstuff Order, 2016.

3. Personnel Not.- 1/12/2018-PER R.R.— Secretariat. 1300

Under Secretary

4.a.Public Works Not.- 6/12/PCE/PWD/EO/ Amendment of Rules of Enlistment of 1305

Principal Chief Engineer /2020-21/64 Contractors in PWD & WRD.

b.—do— Ord.- 50/1/2019-20/PCE- Allotment of office/Divisionwise final 1312

-PWD-Tech.Cell/216 sanctioned strength of the Technical Posts.

c. —do— Ord.- 50/1/2020-21/PCE-PWD- —do— 1336

-Tech.cell/102

d. —do— Ord.- 50/1/2019-20/PCE-PWD- Replacement of Annexures. 1373

-Tech.cell/223

5. Revenue Not.- 16/1/13/2019-REV-I Draft Rules— The Goa Land Revenue 1376

Under Secretary (Property Register) Rules, 2020.

GOVERNMENT OF GOA

Department of Animal Husbandry &

Veterinary Services
__

Corrigendum

13-91/Kamd/(S)/2020-21/4437

Read: (1) Kamdhenu Scheme (Sudharit)

notified vide Notification No. 13-91/

/Kamd/(S)/2012-13/4109 dated

05-11-2012 published in Official

Gazette, Series I No. 33 dated

15-11-2012.

(2) Kamdhenu Scheme (Sudharit)

amended vide Notification No.

13-91/Kamd/(S)/2014-15/911 dated

27-05-2014 published in Official

Gazette, Series I No. 10 dated

05-06-2014.



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1298

(3) Kamdhenu Scheme (Sudharit)

amended vide Notification No. 13-

-91/Kamd/(S)/2015-16/1563 dated

19-06-2015 published in Official

Gazette, Series I No. 13 dated

25-06-2015.

(4) Kamdhenu Scheme (Sudharit)

amended vide Notification No. 13-

-91/Kamd/(S)/2015-16/3341 dated

02-09-2015 published in Official

Gazette, Series I No. 24 dated

10-09-2015.

(5) Kamdhenu Scheme (Sudharit)

amended vide Notification No. 13-

-91/Kamd/(S)/2015-16/3539 dated

23-09-2015 published in Official

Gazette, Series I No. 27 dated

01-10-2015.

(6) Kamdhenu Scheme (Sudharit)

amended vide Notification No. 13-

-91/Kamd/(S)/2016-17/2592 dated

05-08-2016 published in Official

Gazette, Series I No. 19 dated

11-08-2016.

(7) Kamdhenu Scheme (Sudharit)

amended vide Notification No. 13-

-91/Kamd/(S)/2016-17/3405 dated

16-09-2016 published in Official

Gazette, Series I No. 25 dated

22-09-2016.

(8) Kamdhenu Scheme (Sudharit)

amended vide Notification No. 13-

-91/Kamd/(S)/2018-19/121 dated

06-04-2018 published in Official

Gazette, Series I No. 3 dated

19-04-2018.

(9) Kamdhenu Scheme (Sudharit)

amended vide Notification No. 13-

-91/Kamd/(S)/2018-19/2782  dated

26-07-2018 published in Official

Gazette, Series I No. 18 dated

02-08-2018 .

(10) Kamdhenu Scheme (Sudharit)

amended vide Notification No. 13-

-91/Kamd/(S)/2019-20/2083 dated

09-07-2019 published in Official

Gazette, Series I No. 15 dated

11-07-2019.

(11) Kamdhenu Scheme (Sudharit)

amended vide Notification No. 13-

-91/Kamd/(S)/2020-21/4148 dated

16-10-2020 published in Official

Gazette, Series I No. 30 dated

22-10-2020.

KAMDHENU SCHEME (SUDHARIT)

AMENDED

Whereas the Government has notified the

Kamdhenu Scheme (Sudharit) Amended

vide Notification No. read at  Sr. No. 1 above

and further amended vide Notification read

at Sr. No. 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10 and 11

above.

 In the above read Notifications, details

guidelines of the Scheme Sr. No. 2, the eligible

applicant should purchase the sanctioned

animals within one year of sanction of the

scheme may be corrected to read as “The

eligible applicant should purchase the

sanctioned animals within one year from the

date of issue of sanction order”.

By order and in the name of the Governor

of Goa.

Dr. Santosh V. Desai, Director & ex officio

Jt. Secretary (AH).

Panaji, 28th October, 2020.



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1299

Department of Civil Supplies and

Consumer Affairs

__

Notification

DCS/ENF/C.O/FS/20-21/322

Order bearing No. S. O. 3776(E) dated 23rd

October, 2020 published in Part II Section 3,

sub-section (ii) of the Gazette of India

(Extraordinary) dated 23rd October, 2020,

issued by Ministry of Consumer Affairs, Food

and Public Distribution, Department of

Consumer Affairs, New Delhi making the

Order further to amend the “The Removal of

Licensing Requirement, Stock Limits and

Movement Restriction on Specified Foodstuff

Order, 2016”, is hereby republished for

general information of the public.

Siddhivinayak S. Naik, Director & ex officio

Jt. Secretary (S&CA).

Panaji, 2nd November, 2020.

_______

MINISTRY OF CONSUMER AFFAIRS, FOOD

AND PUBLIC DISTRIBUTION

(Department of Consumer Affairs)

Order

New Delhi, the 23rd October, 2020.

S.O. 3776 (E).— In exercise of the powers

conferred by section 3 of the Essential

Commodities Act, 1955 (10 of 1955), the

Central Government hereby makes the

following order further to amend the Removal

of Licensing Requirements, Stock Limits and

Movement Restrictions on Specified Foodstuffs

Order, 2016, namely:—

1. Short title and commencement.— (1) This

order may be called the Removal of Licensing

Requirements, Stock Limits and Movement

Restrictions on Specified Foodstuffs (Second

Amendment) Order, 2020.

(2) It shall come into force with

immediate effect.

2. In the Removal of Licensing

Requirements, Stock Limits and Movement

Restrictions on Specified Foodstuffs Order,

2016, in clause 3, in sub-clause (2), after the

item (iii), the following item shall be inserted

namely:—

“(iv) Onion, for a period up to the 31st

December, 2020 with following stock limits

on traders for all the States and Union

Territories;

Wholesaler: 25 MT and Retailer: 2 MT

Provided that an importer, being a

wholesaler or retailer or dealer shall be

exempted for the imported stock of onions.

[F. No. S-10/3/2017-ECR & E]

ANUPAM MISHRA, Jt. Secy.

Note: The principal order was published in the

Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3,

Sub-section (i), vide number G.S.R. 929(E), dated

the 29th September, 2016 and was subsequently

amended vide numbers S.O. 3341 (E), dated the

27th October, 2016, S.O. 1288(E), dated the 25th

April, 2017, S.O. 1600(E), dated the 17th May, 2017,

S.O. 2785 (E), dated the 25th August, 2017, S.O.

3136(E), dated the 27th September, 2017, S.O.

3397(E), dated the 23rd October, 2017, S.O. 3422(E),

dated the 25th October, 2017, S.O. 4079(E), dated

the 27th December, 2017, S.O. 2414(E) dated the

13th June, 2018, S.O. 2826(E), dated the 6th August,

2019, S.O. 3540(E), dated the 29th September, 2019,

S.O. 4298(E), dated the 28th November, 2019, S.O.

4341 (E) dated the 3rd December, 2019, S.O. 4417(E),

dated the 10th December, 2019, S.O. 4471(E) dated

the 16th December, 2019 and S.O. 901(E) dated the

27th February, 2020.



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1300

Department of Personnel
__

Notification

1/12/2018-PER

In exercise of the powers conferred by the

proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of

India and in supersession of the Government

Notifications specified in rule 7 hereto, the

Governor of Goa hereby makes the following

rules to regulate the recruitment to the Group

‘C’, Ministerial, Non-Gazetted posts, in the

Secretariat, Government of Goa, namely:—

1. Short title, application and commence-

ment.— (1) These rules may be called the

Government of Goa, Secretariat, Group ‘C’,

Ministerial, Non-Gazetted posts, Recruitment

Rules, 2020.

(2) They shall apply to the post specified in

column (2) of the Schedule to these Rules

(hereinafter called as the “said Schedule”).

(3) They shall come into force from the date

of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. Number, classification and level in the

pay matrix.— The number of posts,

classification of the said post and level in the

pay matrix attached thereof shall be as

specified in columns (3) to (5) of the said

Schedule:

Provided that the Government may vary

the number of posts as specified in column

(3) of the said Schedule from time to time

subject to exigencies of work.

3. Method of recruitment, age limit and

other qualifications.— The method of

recruitment to the said post, age limit,

qualifications and other matters connected

therewith shall be as specified in columns

(6) to (14) of the said Schedule.

4. Disqualification.— No person who has

entered into or contracted a marriage with a

person having a spouse living or who, having

a spouse living, has entered into or contracted

a marriage with any person, shall be eligible

for appointment to the service:

Provided that the Government may, if

satisfied that such marriage is permissible

under the personal law applicable to such

person and the other party to the marriage

and that there are other grounds for so doing,

exempt any person from the operation of this

rule.

5. Power to relax.— Where, the Government

is of the opinion that it necessary or expedient

so to do, it may, by order, for reasons to be

recorded in writing, relax any of the

provisions of these rules with respect to any

class or category of persons.

6. Saving.— Nothing in these rules shall

affect reservation, relaxation of age limit and

other concessions required to be provided

for Scheduled Castes, Scheduled Tribes, Other

Backward Classes, Ex-servicemen and other

special categories of persons in accordance

with the orders issued by the Government

from time to time in that regard.

7. These rules are issued in supersession of

the following Government Notifications.— (i)

No. 1/11/84-PER (Pt. I) dated 26-10-2006,

published in the Official Gazette, Series I

No. 32 dated 09-11-2006;

(ii) No. 1/11/84-PER (Pt. I) dated 22-01-2014,

published in the Official Gazette, Series I

No. 45 dated 06-02-2014, and

(iii) No. 1/11/84-PER dated 22-03-2006,

published in the Official Gazette, Series I

No. 51 dated 23-03-2006.

By order and in the name of the

Governor of Goa.

Shashank V. Thakur, Under Secretary

(Personnel).

Porvorim, 29th October, 2020.



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1301

S
C

H
E

D
U

L
E

N
a
m

e
/

/d
es

ig
-

n
a
ti

o
n

 o
f

p
o

s
t

A
g

e

li
m

it

fo
r

d
ir

e
c
t

re
c
ru

it
s

P
e
ri

o
d

 o
f

p
ro

b
a
ti

o
n

, 
if

a
n

y

M
e
th

o
d

 o
f

re
c
ru

it
m

e
n

t,

w
h

e
th

e
r 

b
y

d
ir

e
c
t

re
c
ru

it
m

e
n

t 
o

r

b
y

 p
ro

m
o

ti
o

n

o
r 

b
y

d
e
p

u
ta

ti
o

n
/

/t
ra

n
sf

e
r/

c
o

n
tr

a
c
t 

a
n

d

p
e
rc

e
n

ta
g

e

o
f 

th
e

v
a
c
a
n

c
ie

s

to
 b

e 
fi

ll
ed

  
b
y

v
a
ri

o
u

s

m
e
th

o
d

s

In
 c

a
se

 o
f

re
c
ru

it
-

m
e
n

t 
b

y

p
ro

m
o

ti
o

n
/

/d
e
p

u
ta

ti
o

n
/

/t
ra

n
sf

e
r,

g
ra

d
es

fr
o

m
 w

h
ic

h

 p
ro

m
o

ti
o

n
/

/d
e
p

u
ta

ti
o

n
/

/t
ra

n
sf

e
r 

is

to
 b

e 
m

ad
e

E
d

u
c
a
ti

o
n

a
l

a
n

d
 o

th
e
r

q
u

a
li

fi
c
a
ti

o
n

s

re
q

u
ir

e
d

 f
o

r

d
ir

e
c
t

re
c
ru

it
s

C
la

ss
if

i-

c
a
ti

o
n

Whether age & educational
qualifications prescribed for the
direct recruits will apply in the

case of promotees

N
u

m
b

e
r

o
f

p
o

st
s

L
e
v

e
l 

in

th
e
 p

a
y

m
a

tr
ix

If
 a

D
.P

.C
./

/D
.S

.C
.

e
x

is
ts

,

w
h
at

 i
s 

it
s

c
o

m
p

o
si

-

ti
o

n

W
h

e
th

e
r

se
le

c
ti

o
n

p
o

st
 o

r

n
o

n
-

-s
e
le

c
ti

o
n

p
o

s
t

C
ir

c
u

m
st

a
n

c
e
s

in
 w

h
ic

h
 t

h
e

G
o
a 

P
u
b
li

c

S
e
rv

ic
e

C
o

m
m

is
si

o
n

is
 t

o
 b

e

c
o

n
su

lt
e
d

 i
n

m
a
k

in
g

re
c
ru

it
m

e
n

t

Serial No.

9
2

 (
2

0
2

0
)

(S
u

b
je

c
t

to

v
a

ri
a

ti
o

n

d
e

p
e

n
-

d
e

n
t 

o
n

w
o

rk
lo

a
d

)

S
e
le

c
-

ti
o
n

.

G
ro

u
p

 ‘C
’,

M
in

is
-

te
ri

a
l

N
o
n

-

-G
a

z
e
tt

e
d

.

L
-6

N
o

t 
e

x
c
e

e
d

in
g

4
5

 
y

e
a

rs

(R
e

la
x

a
b

le
 f

o
r

G
o

v
e

r
n

m
e

n
t

s
e

rv
a

n
ts

 u
p

to

fi
v
e
 y

e
a

rs
 i
n

 a
c
-

c
o

rd
a

n
c
e

 w
it

h

th
e
 in

s
tr

u
c
ti

o
n

s

o
r 
o
rd

e
rs

 is
s
u

e
d

b
y

 t
h

e
 G

o
v

e
rn

-

m
e

n
t 

fr
o

m
 t

im
e

to
 t
im

e
.

E
s
s
e
n

ti
a

l:

(1
) 
D

e
g

re
e
 o

f 
a

 r
e
c
-

o
g

n
iz

e
d

 u
n

iv
e
rs

it
y

o
r 

e
q

u
iv

a
le

n
t.

(2
) 
M

in
im

u
m

 t
h

re
e

m
o

n
th

s
 c

e
rt

if
ic

a
te

c
o

u
rs

e
 i
n

 C
o

m
p

u
t-

e
rs

.

(3
) 

K
n

o
w

le
d

g
e

 o
f

K
o

n
k
a

n
i.

D
e
s
ir

a
b

le
:

K
n

o
w

le
d

g
e

 
o

f

M
a

ra
th

i.

N
o
.

T
w

o
 y

e
a

rs

fo
r 

d
ir

e
c
t

re
c
ru

it
s
.

S
e
n

io
r

A
s
s
is

-

ta
n

t.

P
ro

m
o
ti

o
n

:

A
s
s
is

ta
n

t
w

it
h

 f
iv

e
y
e
a

rs
 r

e
g

u
la

r
s
e
rv

ic
e
 i
n

 t
h

e
g

ra
d

e
.

1
2

3
4

5
6

7
8

9
1
0

1
1

1
2

1
3

1
4

G
ro

u
p

‘C
’,

D
.P

.C
./

D
.S

.C
.

N
.A

.
1
.

6
0
%

 b
y

p
ro

m
o
ti

o
n

,

fa
il

in
g

w
h

ic
h

, b
y

d
ir

e
c
t

re
c
ru

it
m

e
n

t

a
n

d
 4

0
%

 b
y

d
ir

e
c
t

re
c
ru

it
m

e
n

t.

8
2

 (
2

0
2

0
)

(S
u

b
je

c
t

to

v
a

ri
a

ti
o

n

d
e

p
e

n
-

d
e

n
t 

o
n

w
o

rk
lo

a
d

)

S
e
le

c
-

ti
o
n

.

L
-4

N
o
.

T
w

o
 y

e
a

rs

fo
r 

d
ir

e
c
t

re
c
ru

it
s
.

A
s
s
is

-

ta
n

t.

P
ro

m
o
ti

o
n

:

J
u

n
io

r
A

s
s
is

ta
n

t
w

it
h

 t
h

re
e

y
e
a

rs
 r

e
g

u
la

r
s
e
rv

ic
e
 i
n

 t
h

e
g

ra
d

e
.

G
ro

u
p

 ‘C
’,

D
.P

.C
./

D
.S

.C
.

N
.A

.
2
.

B
y

p
ro

m
o
ti

o
n

,

fa
il

in
g

w
h

ic
h

, b
y

D
ir

e
c
t

re
c
ru

it
-

m
e
n

t.

G
ro

u
p

 ‘C
’,

M
in

is
-

te
ri

a
l

N
o
n

-

-G
a

z
e
tt

e
d

.

N
o

t 
e

x
c
e

e
d

in
g

4
5

 
y

e
a

rs

(R
e

la
x

a
b

le
 f

o
r

G
o

v
e

r
n

m
e

n
t

s
e

rv
a

n
ts

 u
p

to

fi
v
e
 y

e
a

rs
 i
n

 a
c
-

c
o

rd
a

n
c
e

 w
it

h

th
e
 in

s
tr

u
c
ti

o
n

s

o
r 
o
rd

e
rs

 is
s
u

e
d

E
s
s
e
n

ti
a

l:

(1
) 
H

ig
h

e
r 

S
e

c
o

n
d

-

a
ry

 S
c
h

o
o

l

C
e
rt

if
ic

a
te

 f
ro

m
 a

re
c
o
g

n
iz

e
d

 B
o
a

rd

o
r 

A
ll

 I
n

d
ia

C
o
u

n
c
il

 f
o
r

T
e

c
h

n
ic

a
l 
E

d
u

c
a

-

ti
o
n

 a
p

p
ro

v
e
d



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1302

1
2

3
4

5
6

7
8

9
1
0

1
1

1
2

1
3

1
4

b
y

 t
h

e
 G

o
v

e
rn

-

m
e

n
t 

fr
o

m
 t

im
e

to
 t
im

e
.

D
ip

lo
m

a
 a

w
a

rd
e
d

b
y
 a

 r
e
c
o
g

n
iz

e
d

S
ta

te
 B

o
a

rd
 o

f
T
e
c
h

n
ic

a
l

E
d

u
c
a

ti
o
n

 o
r

e
q

u
iv

a
le

n
t

q
u

a
li

fi
c
a

ti
o
n

 f
ro

m
a

 r
e
c
o
g

n
iz

e
d

In
s
ti

tu
ti

o
n

.

(2
) 
M

in
im

u
m

 t
h

re
e

m
o
n

th
s
 c

e
rt

if
ic

a
te

c
o
u

rs
e
 i
n

C
o
m

p
u

te
rs

.

(3
) 
K

n
o
w

le
d

g
e
 o

f
K

o
n

k
a

n
i.

D
e
s
ir

a
b

le
:

K
n

o
w

le
d

g
e
 o

f
M

a
ra

th
i.

N
o
t 

e
x
c
e
e
d

in
g

4
5
 y

e
a

rs

(R
e

la
x
a

b
le

 f
o

r

G
o
v
e
rn

m
e
n

t

s
e
rv

a
n

ts
 u

p
to

fi
v

e
 y

e
a

rs
 i
n

a
c
c
o
rd

a
n

c
e

w
it

h
 t

h
e

in
s
tr

u
c
ti

o
n

s
 o

r

o
rd

e
rs

 i
s
s
u

e
d

b
y
 t

h
e
 G

o
v
e
rn

-

m
e
n

t 
fr

o
m

 t
im

e

to
 t
im

e
).

T
w

o
 y

e
a

rs
.

G
ro

u
p

‘C
’,

D
.S

.C
./

D
.P

.C
.

N
.A

.
1

0
8

(2
0

2
0

)

(S
u

b
je

c
t

to

v
a

ri
a

ti
o

n

d
e

p
e

n
-

d
e

n
t 

o
n

w
o

rk
lo

a
d

)

S
e
le

c
-

ti
o
n

.

G
ro

u
p

 ‘C
’,

M
in

is
-

te
ri

a
l,

N
o
n

-

-G
a

z
e
tt

e
d

.

L
-2

J
u

n
io

r

A
s
s
is

-

ta
n

t.

3
.

E
s
s
e
n

ti
a

l:

(1
) 
H

ig
h

e
r 

S
e

c
o

n
d

-

a
ry

 S
c
h

o
o

l

C
e
rt

if
ic

a
te

 f
ro

m
 a

re
c
o
g

n
iz

e
d

 B
o
a

rd

o
r 

A
ll

 I
n

d
ia

 C
o
u

n
c
il

fo
r 

T
e
c
h

n
ic

a
l

E
d

u
c
a

ti
o
n

a
p

p
ro

v
e
d

 D
ip

lo
m

a

a
w

a
rd

e
d

 b
y

 a

re
c
o
g

n
iz

e
d

 S
ta

te

B
o

a
rd

 o
f 
T
e

c
h

n
ic

a
l

E
d

u
c
a

ti
o
n

 o
r

e
q

u
iv

a
le

n
t

q
u

a
li

fi
c
a

ti
o
n

 f
ro

m

a
 r

e
c
o
g

n
iz

e
d

In
s
ti

tu
ti

o
n

.

(2
) 
M

in
im

u
m

 t
h

re
e

m
o
n

th
s
 c

e
rt

if
ic

a
te

c
o
u

rs
e
 i
n

 C
o
m

p
u

t-

e
rs

.

(3
) 
M

in
im

u
m

ty
p

in
g

 s
p

e
e
d

 o
f 
3
0

A
g

e
: 
N

o
.

E
d

u
c
a

-

ti
o
n

a
l

q
u

a
li

fi
-

c
a

ti
o
n

s
:

A
s

in
d

i-

c
a

te
d

 i
n

C
o
lu

m
n

N
o
. 1

1

P
ro

m
o
ti

o
n

:

M
u

lt
i-
T
a

s
k
in

g
S

ta
ff

 w
it

h
th

re
e
 y

e
a

rs
re

g
u

la
r 

s
e
rv

ic
e

in
 t

h
e

 g
ra

d
e

a
n

d
p

o
s
s
e
s
s
in

g
fo

ll
o
w

in
g

q
u

a
li

fi
c
a

ti
o
n

s
:

(i
) 
P

a
s
s
e

d
S

e
c
o
n

d
a

ry
S

c
h

o
o
l

C
e
rt

if
ic

a
te

 o
r

e
q

u
iv

a
le

n
t

q
u

a
li

fi
c
a

ti
o
n

fr
o

m
 a

re
c
o
g

n
iz

e
d

B
o

a
rd

/
in

s
ti

tu
ti

o
n

.

(i
i)

 K
n

o
w

le
d

g
e

o
f 
c
o
m

p
u

te
r

a
p

p
li

c
a

ti
o
n

s
/

O
p

e
ra

ti
o
n

s

1
3
%

 b
y

p
ro

m
o
ti

o
n

,

fa
il

in
g

w
h

ic
h

, b
y

d
ir

e
c
t

re
c
ru

it
m

e
n

t

a
n

d
 8

7
%

 b
y

d
ir

e
c
t

re
c
ru

it
-

m
e
n

t.



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1303

w
o
rd

s
 p

e
r 

m
in

u
te

in
 E

n
g

il
is

h
.

(4
) 
K

n
o
w

le
d

g
e
 o

f

K
o

n
k
a

n
i.

D
e
s
ir

a
b

le
:

K
n

o
w

le
d

g
e
 o

f

M
a

ra
th

i.

1
2

3
4

5
6

7
8

9
1
0

1
1

1
2

1
3

1
4

w
it

h
 m

in
im

u
m

ty
p

in
g

 s
p

e
a

d
o
f 
3
0
 w

o
rd

s
p

e
r 

m
in

u
te

 i
n

E
n

g
li

s
h

.

N
o
t 

e
x
c
e
e
d

in
g

4
5
 y

e
a

rs

(R
e

la
x
a

b
le

 f
o

r

G
o
v
e
rn

m
e
n

t

s
e
rv

a
n

ts
 u

p
to

fi
v

e
 y

e
a

rs
 i
n

a
c
c
o
rd

a
n

c
e

w
it

h
 t

h
e

in
s
tr

u
c
ti

o
n

s
 o

r

o
rd

e
rs

 i
s
s
u

e
d

b
y
 t

h
e
 G

o
v
e
rn

-

m
e
n

t 
fr

o
m

 t
im

e

to
 t
im

e
).

2
5

 (
2

0
2

0
)

(S
u

b
je

c
t

to

v
a

ri
a

ti
o

n

d
e

p
e

n
-

d
e

n
t 

o
n

w
o

rk
lo

a
d

)

S
e
le

c
-

ti
o
n

.

G
ro

u
p

 ‘C
’,

M
in

is
-

te
ri

a
l,

N
o
n

-

-G
a

z
e
tt

e
d

.

L
-6

S
te

n
o
g

-

ra
p

h
e
r

G
ra

d
e
-I

4
.

E
s
s
e
n

ti
a

l:

(1
) 
H

ig
h

e
r

S
e
c
o
n

d
a

ry
 S

c
h

o
o
l

C
e
rt

if
ic

a
te

 f
ro

m
 a

re
c
o
g

n
iz

e
d

 B
o
a

rd

o
r 

A
ll

 I
n

d
ia

C
o
u

n
c
il

 f
o
r

T
e
c
h

n
ic

a
l

E
d

u
c
a

ti
o
n

a
p

p
ro

v
e
d

 D
ip

lo
m

a

a
w

a
rd

e
d

 b
y

 a

re
c
o
g

n
iz

e
d

 S
ta

te

B
o

a
rd

 o
f

T
e
c
h

n
ic

a
l

E
d

u
c
a

ti
o
n

 o
r

e
q

u
iv

a
le

n
t

q
u

a
li

fi
c
a

ti
o
n

 f
ro

m

a
 r

e
c
o
g

n
iz

e
d

In
s
ti

tu
ti

o
n

.

(2
) 
S

p
e

e
d

 o
f 
1
2
0

w
o
rd

s
 p

e
r 

m
in

u
te

in
 S

h
o

rt
 H

a
n

d
 a

n
d

4
0
 w

o
rd

s
 p

e
r

m
in

u
te

 i
n

 t
y
p

in
g

.

(3
) 
M

in
im

u
m

 t
h

re
e

m
o
n

th
s
 c

e
rt

if
ic

a
te

c
o
u

rs
e
 i
n

C
o
m

p
u

te
rs

.

(4
) 
K

n
o
w

le
d

g
e
 o

f

K
o

n
k
a

n
i.

D
e
s
ir

a
b

le
:

K
n

o
w

le
d

g
e
 o

f

M
a

ra
th

i.

N
o
.

T
w

o
 y

e
a

rs

fo
r 

d
ir

e
c
t

re
c
ru

it
s
.

P
ro

m
o
ti

o
n

:
S

te
n

o
g

ra
p

h
e
r

G
ra

d
e
-I

I 
w

it
h

th
re

e
 y

e
a

rs
re

g
u

la
r 

s
e
rv

ic
e

in
 t

h
e
 g

ra
d

e
.

G
ro

u
p

 ‘C
’,

D
.P

.C
./

D
.S

.C
.

N
.A

.
B

y

p
ro

m
o
ti

o
n

,

fa
il

in
g

w
h

ic
h

, b
y

d
ir

e
c
t

re
c
ru

it
-

m
e
n

t.



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1304

1
2

3
4

5
6

7
8

9
1
0

1
1

1
2

1
3

1
4

N
o
t 

e
x
c
e
e
d

in
g

4
5
 y

e
a

rs

(R
e

la
x
a

b
le

 f
o

r

G
o
v
e
rn

m
e
n

t

s
e
rv

a
n

ts
 u

p
to

fi
v

e
 y

e
a

rs
 i
n

a
c
c
o
rd

a
n

c
e

w
it

h
 t

h
e

in
s
tr

u
c
ti

o
n

s
 o

r

o
rd

e
rs

 i
s
s
u

e
d

b
y
 t

h
e
 G

o
v
e
rn

-

m
e
n

t 
fr

o
m

 t
im

e

to
 t
im

e
).

2
8

 (
2

0
2

0
)

(S
u

b
je

c
t

to

v
a

ri
a

ti
o

n

d
e

p
e

n
-

d
e

n
t 

o
n

w
o

rk
lo

a
d

)

N
.A

.
G

ro
u

p
 ‘C

’,

M
in

is
-

te
ri

a
l,

N
o
n

-

-G
a

z
e
tt

e
d

.

L
-4

.
S

te
n

o
g

-

ra
p

h
e
r

G
ra

d
e
-I

I

5
.

E
s
s
e
n

ti
a

l:

(1
) 
H

ig
h

e
r

S
e
c
o
n

d
a

ry
 S

c
h

o
o
l

C
e
rt

if
ic

a
te

 f
ro

m
 a

re
c
o
g

n
iz

e
d

 B
o
a

rd

o
r 

A
ll

 I
n

d
ia

C
o
u

n
c
il

 f
o
r

T
e
c
h

n
ic

a
l

E
d

u
c
a

ti
o
n

a
p

p
ro

v
e
d

 D
ip

lo
m

a

a
w

a
rd

e
d

 b
y

 a

re
c
o
g

n
iz

e
d

 S
ta

te

B
o

a
rd

 o
f 
T
e

c
h

n
i-

c
a

l 
E

d
u

c
a

ti
o

n
 o

r

e
q

u
iv

a
le

n
t

q
u

a
li

fi
c
a

ti
o
n

 f
ro

m

a
 r

e
c
o
g

n
iz

e
d

In
s
ti

tu
ti

o
n

.

(2
) 
S

p
e

e
d

 o
f 
1
0
0

w
o
rd

s
 p

e
r 

m
in

u
te

in
 S

h
o

rt
 H

a
n

d

a
n

d
 3

5
 w

o
rd

s
 p

e
r

m
in

u
te

 i
n

 t
y
p

in
g

.

(3
) 
M

in
im

u
m

th
re

e
 m

o
n

th
s

c
e
rt

if
ic

a
te

 c
o
u

rs
e

in
 C

o
m

p
u

te
rs

.

(4
) 
K

n
o
w

le
d

g
e
 o

f

K
o

n
k
a

n
i.

D
e
s
ir

a
b

le
:

K
n

o
w

le
d

g
e
 o

f

M
a

ra
th

i.

N
.A

.
T
w

o
 y

e
a

rs
N

.A
.

G
ro

u
p

 ‘C
’,

D
.P

.C
./

D
.S

.C
.

N
.A

.
B

y
 d

ir
e
c
t

re
c
ru

it
-

m
e
n

t.



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1305

Department of Public Works

Office of the Principal Chief Engineer

__

Notification

6/12/PCE/PWD/EO/2020-21/64

Read:- Notification No. 6/12/PCE/EO/2020-

21/06 dated 08-05-2020 regarding

Rules of Rules of Enlistment of

Contractors in Public Works

Department (PWD)/Water Resource

Department (WRD), 2020.

In the said rules, following changes are

made:—

1. The rule 3.2 will be substituted by:—

“Notwithstanding such repeal, the

contractors already enlisted on the basis of

rules hitherto in force shall continue to enjoy

the status of enlisted contractors of PWD/

WRD, Goa with their respective tendering

limits of old registration for a period of 1 year,

w.e.f. 01-10-2020 or till the existing Enlistment

expires, whichever is earlier.

The existing enlisted contractors in PWD/

/WRD, will be issued new enlistment for a

period of 5 years in the respective classes

and categories by raising the tendering limit

on payment of difference in fees as per new

rules on pro rata basis if they apply along

with a undertaking for deployment of

Engineering Establishment and T&P

Machinery prescribed Proforma (Annexure

XII). For class I, I-A & I-B enlistments

Solvency Certificate shall also be submitted

in prescribed Proforma (Annexure V-A) as

specified in rule 10 for fresh enlistment in

this Enlistment Rules. However, in regard to

all other matters and further renewal/

extension of their enlistment, they shall be

governed by this Enlistment Rules.”

2. The rule 8.2 shall be substituted by the

following:— “Registered office of the

contractor has to be in the State of Goa as

jurisdiction for registration of class and

category in which enlistment is sought. Also,

it shall be registered with any of local bodies

in Goa.”

3. The rule 10.0 for categories:— (i)

Buildings (BLDGS).

(ii) Road, Bridges and Land Development

(RBLD).

(iii) Water Supply and Waste Water Disposal

(WS&WWD).

(iv) Water Resources Works including

Hydraulics & Marine Water (WR)

Following are the changes:

(A)  In the rule 10.0 under sub-heading

“CLASS I-AA/I-A/I-B” and point (a),

following shall be substituted:

“Contractors desiring enlistment in

this Class should have a Permanent

Engineering Organization capable of

dealing with large works in all their

stages. They should have sufficient

machinery and tools, etc. at their

disposal.

Contractors desiring enlistment in

class I-AA should submit along with

their application, full details about their

Permanent Engineering Organization

and Tools and Machinery as listed in

Table I of the Enlistment Rules, 2020

along with muster roll of salaries paid to

the staff for last one year.

Contractors desiring enlistment in

class I-A and class I-B should submit an

undertaking in prescribed Proforma

(Annexure XII)  in respect of Engineering

Establishment and T&P Machinery

required upon the contracts. In case, it

is observed that the contractor does not

deploy the requisite T&P/Machinery,

either owned or hired as per requirement

of work or the contractor does not deploy

the requisite Technical staff, then the

contractor is liable for disciplinary action

under this Enlistment Rules.”

(B) In the rule 10.0 under sub-heading

“CLASS I-AA/I-A/I-B” and point (c), for the

words and figures “Rs. 2000.00/1000.00/

300.00 lakhs”, the words and figures

“Rs. 2000.00/500.00/150.00 lakhs” shall be

substituted.



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1306

(C) In the rule 10.0 under sub-heading

“CLASS II” and point (a), following shall

be substituted:

“Contractors desiring enlistment in

this Class should have a Permanent

Engineering Organization capable of

dealing with large works in all their

stages. They should have sufficient

machinery and tools, etc. at their

disposal. They should submit an

undertaking in prescribed Proforma

(Annexure XII) in respect of Engineering

Establishment and T&P Machinery

required upon the contracts. In case, it

is observed that the contractor does not

deploy the requisite T&P/Machinery,

either owned or hired as per requirement

of work or the contractor does not deploy

the requisite Technical staff, then the

contractor is liable for disciplinary action

under this Enlistment Rules.”

(D) In the rule 10.0 under sub-heading

“CLASS II” and point (b)(i),  for the words

and figures “not less than Rs. 50.00 lakhs”,

the words and figures “not less than

Rs.15.00 lakhs” shall be substituted.

(E) In the rule 10.0 under sub-heading

“CLASS II” and point (b)(ii), following shall

be substituted:

“The individual or one of the partners

of the firm should however be a qualified

graduate Civil Engineer of recognized

University with not less than 10 years

experience and has to submit continuous

Residency Certificate in the State of Goa

of 5 years prior to date of application.”

(F) In the rule 10.0 under sub-heading

“CLASS III/IV” shall be substituted as

follows:

(a) Contractors desiring enlistment in

this class should have sufficient

machinery and tools, etc. at their

disposal. They should submit an

undertaking in prescribed Proforma

(Annexure XII) in respect of Engineering

Establishment and T&P Machinery

required upon the contracts. In case, it

is observed that the contractor does not

deploy the requisite T&P/Machinery,

either owned or hired as per requirement

of work or the contractor does not deploy

the requisite Technical staff, then the

contractor is liable for disciplinary action

under this Enlistment Rules.

(b) The applicant desiring enlistment

in this class should have satisfactorily

executed/completed at least three

works of Central/State Government

departments, Government Organiza-

tions/Autonomous Bodies/Corporations

in the respective category viz. BLDGS/

RBLD/WS&WWD/WR each costing not

less than Rs. 10.00/3.00 lakhs

respectively during the last five years,

on the date of application. The applicant

shall submit along with the application

the certificates of the aforesaid works

from the clients in the prescribed

Proforma (Annexure-IV) in original.

OR

(b) The applicant having no past

experience of works shall also be eligible

for enlistment in this class provided–

(i) The applicant furnishes a

Working Capital Certificate for not less

than Rs. 5.00/1.50 lakhs respectively

in the prescribed Proforma (Annexure-

V-B) from his bankers. Such Certificate

shall be issued by a Scheduled Bank

and shall be submitted, in original, in

a Bank sealed cover, addressed to the

Enlistment Authority.

(ii) For enlistment in class III, the

individual or one of the partners of the

firm should however be a qualified

graduate Civil Engineer of recognized

University with not less than 3 year’s

experience or a diploma Civil Engineer

from recognized Board with not less

than 10 year’s experience. For

enlistment in class IV, the individual



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1307

or one of the partners of the firm

should however be a qualified

graduate Civil Engineer of recognized

University or a diploma Civil Engineer

from recognized Board with not less

than 5 year’s experience.”

4. In the rule 10.0 under sub-heading

“Special Subcategory under WS&WWD and

RBLD - CLASS II/III/IV” and point (b), for the

words and figures “Rs. 50.00/20.00/3.00

lakhs”, the words and figures “Rs. 15.00/5.00/

1.50 lakhs” shall be substituted.

5. In the rule 10.0 under sub-heading

“ELECTRICAL – CLASS–I-A/I-B” and point

(a), following shall be substituted:

“Applicant desiring enlistment in this

class should have a Permanent

Engineering Organisation capable of

dealing with large works in all their stages,

possessing a valid Electrical License from

Goa Licensing Board.  They should have

sufficient machinery and tools, etc. at their

disposal. They should submit an

undertaking in prescribed Proforma

(Annexure XII) in respect of Engineering

Establishment and T&P Machinery

required upon the contracts. In case, it is

observed that the contractor does not

deploy the requisite T&P/Machinery, either

owned or hired as per requirement of work

or the contractor does not deploy the

requisite Technical staff, then the

contractor is liable for disciplinary action

under this Enlistment Rules.”

6. The rule 10.0 under the sub-heading

ELECTRICAL–CLASS–II/III point (a), following

shall be substituted:

“Applicant desiring enlistment in this

class should have a Permanent

Engineering Organisation capable of

dealing with large works in all their stages,

possessing a valid Electrical License from

Goa Licensing Board.  They should have

sufficient machinery and tools, etc. at their

disposal. They should submit an

undertaking in prescribed Proforma

(Annexure XII) in respect of Engineering

Establishment and T&P Machinery

required upon the contracts. In case, it is

observed that the contractor does not

deploy the requisite T&P/Machinery, either

owned or hired as per requirement of work

or the contractor does not deploy the

requisite Technical staff, then the

contractor is liable for disciplinary action

under this Enlistment Rules.”

7. In the rule 10.0 under sub-heading

“ELECTRICAL-CLASS II/III” and point (b)(i),

for the words and figures “Rs. 20.00/5.00

lakhs”, the words and figures “Rs. 5.00/1.50

lakhs” shall be substituted.

8. The rule 10.0 under the sub-heading

ELECTRICAL–CLASS–II/III point (b) (ii) shall

be substituted as follows:

“For Enlistment in Class II, the individual

or one of the partners of the firm should be

a qualified Engineer possessing a

recognized University Degree in Electrical

Engineering and having experience of not

less than 5 years or a recognized Diploma

in Electrical Engineering with not less than

15 years experience. For enlistment in class

III, the individual or one of the partners of

the firm should be a qualified Engineer

possessing a recognized University Degree

in Electrical Engineering or a recognized

Diploma in Electrical Engineering with not

less than 5 years experience.”

9. In the rule 10.0 under sub-heading

“ELECTRICAL-CLASS IV” and point (b)(i), for

the words and figures “Rs. 2.00 lakhs”,  the

words and figures “Rs. 1.00 lakhs” shall be

substituted.

10. The rule 10.0 under the sub-heading

ELECTRICAL–CLASS–IV point (a), the words

“as listed in Table I of the Enlistment Rules,

2020”, shall be deleted.

11. In the rule 10.0 under sub-heading

“FURNITURE - CLASS II/III” and point (c),

for the words and figures “Rs. 15.00/3.00

lakhs”, the words and figures “Rs. 5.00/1.50

lakhs” shall be substituted.



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1308

12. In the rule 26.5 for the words and figures “clause 25.4” the words and figures “clause

26.4” shall be substituted.

13. The existing Annexure-VA of Enlistment Rules, 2020, shall be substituted with the

Annexure-VA annexed hereto.

14.  The existing Table-I of Enlistment Rules, 2020, shall be substituted with the Table-I

annexed hereto.

15. The proforma ANNEXURE XII for undertaking annexed hereto shall be added.

16. In rule 14.0 the words “as mentioned in Table 1 of enlistment rules and” shall be

deleted.

17. The other content of the notification shall remain unchanged.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Goa.

U. P. Parsekar, Principal Chief Engineer, PWD & ex officio Addl. Secretary.

Panaji, 28th October, 2020.

________

ANNEXURE – V-A

Proforma For Solvency Certificate

CLASS I-AA(Super)/I-AA/I-A/I-B.

SOLVENCY CERTIFICATE

This to certify that to the best of our knowledge and information M/s./Shri ………....... having marginally

noted address, a customer of our bank are/is respectable and can be treated as good for any engagement

up to a limit of Rs. ……………… (Rupees………………..).

This certificate is issued without any guarantee or responsibility on the Bank or any of the officers.

This certificate is issued on the request of Shri/Smt./M/s .................................... for obtaining enlistment/

revalidation of Enlistment in PWD in ................... (Name of Category) class .......................

(Signature with rubber stamp)

Bank Seal                                                              of the Branch Manager.

NOTE: In case of partnership firm, certificate to include names of all partners as recorded with the Bank.

ANNEXURE XII

(In respect of Engineering Establishment and T&P Machinery)

(To be typed on Rs. 100/- stamp paper and executed before Executive Magistrate OR Notary

public)

UNDERTAKING

1. I/We undertake that, if I/we do not own tools and plant machinery, then I shall/we will hire or

otherwise arrange the required tools and plant machinery required for the works we procure as a

result of this enlistment.

2. I/We undertake that, if I/we do not employ technical staff, then I shall/we will hire or otherwise

arrange the required Engineering Establishment required for the works we procure as a result of this

enlistment.



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1309

3. I am/We are aware that in case I/we fail to deploy the requisite T&P Machinery, either owned or hired

as per requirement of works we procure as a result of this enlistment or I/We fail to deploy the

Technical staff as per the requirement of work we procure as a result of this enlistment , then I shall/

We will be liable for disciplinary action under this Enlistment Rules.

Table–I Enlistment Rules, 2020

Category Class Jurisdiction & Engineering establishment T & P Machinery

Enlistment

Authority

1 2 3 4 5

All types of I AA All Goa Pvt./Public Limited Firm i) Total Stations: 2 No.

works (Super) having total Engineering ii) Building Hoist/Tower crane:

 including setup including Civil, 3 Nos.

Roads, Electrical & Mechanical, iii) Concrete mixer of full bag

buildings, Architectural, Design, QC  capacity: 5 Nos.

WS&WWD, wings inhouse with

WR, E&M, a) two Graduate Engineer iv) Sheet Shuttering 10000 sq. mts.

etc. and (Civil) with 20 years in good condition (procured

composite experience during last 3 years)

works b) two Graduate Engineer v) Steel props for 25000 cu.mt.

(1 Civil and 1 Elect) with space in in good condition

15 years experience. Atleast (procured during last 3 years)

one with experience in

structural design

c) two Graduate Engineers vi) Mortar mixer: 4 Nos.

with 10 years experience. vii) Needle vibrator: 20 Nos (10 :

One Engineer with experience oil, 10: electric)

in Quality Control and one

Electrical Engineer

OR

c) three diploma holder with viii) Beam Vibrator: 4 Nos.

15 years experience. Atleast

one with experience in Quality

Control and one in Electrical

field

d) two diploma engineers ix) slab vibrator: 4 Nos.

with 10 years experience x) Shutter vibrator: 3 No.

(1 electrical/Mechanical) xi) Vibro compactor: 3 No.

OR

d) three diploma engineers xii) Batching plant: 3 No.

with 5 years experience (1 xiii) Wet Macadom mix plant: 2 No.

electrical/Mechanical) xiv) Hotmix plant 40/60 MTPH:

2 No.

xv) Hydraulic sensor paver finisher:

3 Nos.

xvi) Static Road Roller: 4 Nos.

xvii) Vibrating Rollers (DD 80) : 3

No.

xviii) Truck/Tipper: 10 Nos.

xix) Water Tanker: 4 No.

xx) Bitumin Sprayer: 4 No.



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1310

1 2 3 4 5

xxi) Air compressor: 3 No.

xxii) Hydraulic loader: 3 No.

xxiii) Concrete Mixer: 3 Nos.

xxiv) Concrete Vibrator: 3 Nos.

xxv) heavy earth moving

machinery like JCB, breakers,

wheel loads, R.R. compactor

xxvi) Safety Equipment.

Roads, I AA All Goa a) one Graduate Engineer For Building Works:

Buildings, (C) with 20 years experience

WS & WWD, b) two Graduate Engineer(C) i) Total Stations: 2 Nos.

WR with 5 years experience

c) two diploma holder with 15 ii) Building Hoist/Tower crane: 2

years experience Nos.

d) three diploma engineers

with 5 years experience iii) Concrete mixer of full bag

capacity: 7 Nos.

iv) Sheet Shuttering 12000 sq. mts.

in good condition (procured during

last 3 years)

v) Steel props for 24000 cu.mt.

space in in good condition

(procured during last 3 years)

vi) Mortar mixer: 3 Nos.

vii) Needle vibrator: 12 Nos. (6 : oil,

6: electric)

viii) Beam vibrator: 3 Nos.

ix) Slab vibrator: 3 Nos.

x) Shutter vibrator: 2 No.

xi) Vibro compactor: 2 No.

xii) Batching plant: 2 No.

xiii) Safety Equipment.

I AA All Goa a) one Graduate Engineer (C) For Roads Works:

with 20 years experience

b) two Graduate Engineer (C) i) Wet Macadom mix plant: 1 No.

with 5 years experience

c) two diploma holder with 15 ii) Hotmix plant 40/60 MTPH: 1 No.

years experience

d) three diploma engineers iii) Hydraulic sensor paver finisher:

with 5 years experience 2 Nos.

iv) Static Road Roller: 3 Nos.

v) Vibrating Rollers (DD 80) : 2 No.

vi) Truck/Tipper: 4 Nos.

vii) Water Tanker: 3 No.

viii) Bitumin Sprayer: 3 No.



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1311

1 2 3 4 5

ix) Air compressor: 2 No.

x) Hydraulic loader: 2 No.

xi) Concrete Mixer: 5 Nos.

xii) Concrete Vibrator: 4 Nos.

xiii) Safety Equipment.

For WS & WWD

i) Truck/Tipper: 4 Nos.

ii) Water Tanker: 3 No.

iii) Air compressor: 2 No.

iv) Hydraulic loader: 2 No.

v) Concrete Mixer: 5 Nos.

vi) Concrete Vibrator: 4 Nos.

vii) heavy earth moving machinery

like JCB, pneumatic breakers,

wheel loader.

viii) Safety Equipment.

I AA All Goa a) one Graduate Engineer For W.R. Works:

(C) with 20 years experience

b) two Graduate Engineer (C) i) Total Stations: 1 No.

with 5 years experience

c) two diploma holder with 15 ii) Concrete mixer of full bag

years experience  capacity: 5 Nos.

d) three diploma engineers

with 5 years experience iii) Sheet Shuttering 2000 sq. mts.

in good condition (procured during

last 3 years).

iv) Steel props for 500 cu.mt. space

in in good condition (procured

during last 3 years).

v) Mortar mixer: 2 Nos.

vi) Needle vibrator: 8 Nos ( 4 : oil,

4: electric).

vii) Beam vibrator: 2 Nos.

viii) Shutter vibrator: 1 No.

ix) Vibro compactor: 1 No.

x) Batching plant: 1 No.

vii) heavy earth moving machinery

like JCB, pneumatic breakers,

wheel loader.

viii) Safety Equipment.



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1312

Order

50/1/2019-20/PCE-PWD-Tech.Cell/216

Whereas vide order No. 50/1/2019-20/PCE-PWD-ADM(II)/71 dated 19-07-2019, sanction of

the Government was accorded for creation of Technical Posts in various categories in PWD.

And whereas vide order No. 50/1/2019-20/PCE-PWD-ADM(II)/72 dated 19-07-2019, final

sanctioned strength of the department was indicated for the next five years as per the

approval of High Level Empowered Committee communicated by the Additional Secretary,

Personnel/Chairman, IDCO, Department of Personnel by Order No. 9/10/HLEC/2018-ARD dated

03-07-2019.

Now, therefore, considering the work load of the Department, allotment of Office/Division

wise final sanctioned strength of the Technical Posts in various categories shall be as per the

Annexure I, II, III, IV, V & VI appended hereto.

U. P. Parsekar, Principal Chief Engineer (PWD).

Panaji, 12th February, 2020.

5

6

7



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1313



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1314

ANNEXURE III

10

25

26



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1315

6

21

22

10



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1316

26

22

23

7



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1317



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1318



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1319



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1320

S
U

B
-D

IV
IS

IO
N

 O
F

F
IC

E
S



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1321



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1322



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1323



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1324



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1325



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1326



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1327



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1328



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1329



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1330



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1331



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1332



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1333



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1334



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1335



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1336

Order

50/1/2020-21/PCE-PWD-Tech.Cell/102

Read: 1) No. 50/1/2019-20/PCE-PWD-Tech.Cell/216 dated 12-02-2020.

2) No. 50/1/2019-20/PCE-PWD-Tech.Cell/223 dated 01-04-2020.

Considering the work load of the Department, allotment of Office/Division wise final

sanctioned strength of the Technical Posts in various categories shall be as per the Annexure

I, II, III, IV, V, VI & VII appended hereto.

This order is issued in supersession to the earlier orders read 1 & 2 above.

U. P. Parsekar, Principal Chief Engineer (PWD).

Panaji, 8th October, 2020.



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1337



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1338



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1339



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1340



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1341



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1342



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1343



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1344



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1345



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1346



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1347



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1348



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1349



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1350



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1351



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1352



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1353



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1354



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1355



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1356



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1357



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1358



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1359



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1360



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1361



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1362



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1363



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1364



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1365



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1366



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1367



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1368



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1369



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1370



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1371



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1372



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1373

Order

50/1/2019-20/PCE-PWD-Tech.cell/223

Read: No. 50/1/2019-20/PCE-PWD-Tech. Cell/216 dated 12-02-2020.

The Annexure II, IV and VI of the above referred order may be replaced with Annexure

II, IV and VI enclosed herewith.

The other contents of the order remains unchanged.

U. P. Parsekar, Principal Chief Engineer (PWD).

Panaji, 1st April, 2020.



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1374



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1375



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1376

Department  of  Revenue

__

Notification

16/1/13/2019-REV-I

The following draft Rules which the

Government of Goa proposes to make in

exercise of the powers conferred by

sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 199 of the

Goa Land Revenue Code, 1968 (Act No. 9 of

1969) are hereby pre-published as required by

sub-section (3) of section 199 of the said Code

for information of the persons likely to be

affected thereby and notice is hereby given

that the said draft Rules shall be taken into

consideration by the Government after expiry

of a period of fifteen days from the date of

publication of this Notification in the Official

Gazette.

All objections and/or suggestions to the said

draft Rules may be forwarded to the Secretary

(Revenue) to the Government of Goa, Revenue

Department, Secretariat, Porvorim, Goa, before

the expiry of the said period of fifteen days so

that they may be taken into consideration at

the time of finalization of the said draft

Rules.

DRAFT RULES

In exercise of the powers conferred by

sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 199 of the

Goa Land Revenue Code, 1968 (Act 9 of 1969)

and all other powers enabling it in this behalf,

the Government of Goa hereby makes the

following rules, namely:—

1. Short title and commencement.— (1)

These rules may be called the Goa Land

Revenue (Property Register) Rules, 2020.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of

their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. Definitions.— (1) In these rules, unless the

context otherwise requires;

(a) “Code” means the Goa Land Revenue

Code, 1968 (Act 9 of 1969);

(b) “Director” means the Director of

Settlement and Land Records;

(c) “Forms” means a form appended to

these Rules;

(d) “land” means the Government land

and land held by any person, and includes

things attached to the earth or permanently

fastened to any thing attached to the earth

or other defined portions thereof;

(e) “Property Register” means a digital

register created and maintained under rule

3, in relation to land;

(f) “State” means the State of Goa;

(g) “Unique property identification

number” means an unique number as

generated under sub-rule 3 of rule 3 in

relation to a property.

(2) Words and expressions used and not

defined in these rules but defined in the Code

shall have the meanings respectively assigned

to them in the Code.

3. Preparation of Property Register.— (1) The

Director shall prepare and maintain a Property

Register in Form “I” hereto.

(2)The first preparation of Property Register

shall be made by the Director by filling up

details is column (1) to column (6) of the

Property Register on the basis of Land Revenue

records, and column (8) and column (9) on the

basis of records obtained from the local bodies

or field survey.

(3) In column (7) of the Property Register,

the Director shall assign to each property a

computer generated unique number for the



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1377

purpose of its identification, through any

algorithm as deemed fit by him.

(4) The Director shall also prepare a Property

Plan by marking general boundaries of each

holding within the Survey Plan only for

indicative purposes and to show its general

position.

(5) The Property Register so prepared shall

be displayed online for the public by the

Director and a notice inviting public comments

to such Property Register shall be published

in the Official Gazette and in at least two

newspapers, one in English and one in

vernacular language having vide circulation

in the State.

(6) The Director shall, after expiration of a

period of fifteen days from the date of

publication of the notice under sub-rule (5) and

after consideration of public comments, if any,

finalise the Property Register in Form I, with

or without any changes.

4. Maintenance and Updation of Property

Register.— (1) The Director shall be the

custodian of the Property Register.

(2) The Director may create additional

Unique property identification numbers and

update the Property Plan, as per such

procedure as may be specified by the

Government.

(3) The Director shall provide an appropriate

access to the Government departments, local

bodies or other agencies to be notified for

entering and updating the information held by

them, in column (10) and onwards, held by

each.

(4) The Director shall undertake efforts to

integrate the database with other Government

departments, local bodies or other agencies

to be notified to capture changes made by

them in their database for collating realtime

property related information.

(5) The Government department, local body

or other agency who is updating the property

related information in the Property Register

shall be,—

(a) liable and responsible for accuracy,

completeness and updating of their

respective information; and

(b) free to change the information so

entered as per the relevant laws, rules,

regulations or practices, without seeking

any consent or approval of the Director.

(6) All Government departments, local

bodies and other agencies shall endeavour to

include Unique property identification number

in their databases and official communications

and dealings.

5. Duties of Government departments, local

bodies or other agencies.— All Government

departments, local bodies or other agencies

shall endeavor to keep the Property Register

updated by recording any encumbrances,

zoning, lien, mortgage, lease, court order,

proceeding, restriction, dispute or other

information possessed or received by

them related to the properties, in the manner

as specified by the Director from time to

time.

6. Fee.— An extract of Property Register can

be downloaded on payment of Rs. 200 per

Unique property identification number. The

extract shall bear a time stamp and/or special

features as may be decided by the Director.

By order and in the name of the Governor

of Goa.

Sudin A. Natu, Under Secretary (Revenue-I).

Porvorim, 4th November, 2020.



OFFICIAL GAZETTE — GOVT. OF GOA

SERIES I No. 32 5TH NOVEMBER, 2020

1378

www.goaprintingpress.gov.in

Printed  and Published  by  the  Director,  Printing  &  Stationery,

Government  Printing  Press,

Mahatma Gandhi Road, Panaji-Goa 403 001.

PRICE – Rs.  82.00

PRINTED AT THE GOVERNMENT PRINTING PRESS, PANAJI-GOA—232/160—11/2020.

Form-I 

 Property Register  

(See rule 3(1)) 

 

D
is

tr
ic

t 
 

T
a

lu
k

a
 

R
e

v
e

n
u

e
 

V
il

la
g

e
 

S
u

rv
e

y
 N

o
./

 

/P
T

 S
h

e
e

t 
N

o
. 

Sub-division 

No./Chalta 

No. 

A
re

a
 (

in
 s

q
. 

m
e

te
rs

) Unique 

Property 

Identification 

No. 

House No./ 

/Flat No./ 

Building No. 

A
d

d
re

s
s
 

Information populated by 

specific Government 

department/local 

body/other agency 

(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6) (7) (8) (9) (10) 

          

    

    

 

 

Property Plan 

 

Note:  

This is a computer generated extract of Property Register as on [time and date].  

Property plan shows the general position, not the exact line, of the boundaries. 

FORM-I


